Bid 6356 Recommended item = | cjayton Paper, 1302 S 58th St. _

Custodial Supplies July 2007 - June 2008 bolded and hightlighted St. Joe, MO 64507 AmSAN, 1501 North Topping Ave,

with 2 optional extensions (the other is an alternate) Avg. Del:1-4 days KC, MO 64120.

MCC - Custodial Supply Products Bid List. _

S " Jim Clayton P: 800-364-0228. .
Items NOT on the list - first go to Clayton paper for pricing and Watch the COSTS of alternates . . . inform F- 816-364-0086 P:816-483-5800 x 234 Sheila Beets
availability Purchasing of any product of unacceptable quality )
Unit of Clayton Item
ltem # Historic Purch: Model/Brand Measure General Category  |Brand/Model Unit of measure | Unit Cost Item Bid Brand/Model Unitof measure | Unit Cost

34 Blue Huck Towels, 16" x 27" BROBTNBHT100 Pk/ 100 paper 539-6902 ¢cs/5-Dzn 20.25 |BROBTNBHT PK/100 69.15
35 Center Pull Towels 28125 Case/ 8 paper 28125 cs/8 36.94| GPT28125 cs/8 43.45

Paper Towel N-fold, natural 9-1/8" x 9-1/2" BWP480 / GP 23304 /
36 200/pk AFMFK200 case/ 20 pks paper SCAMKS520 €s/4000 shts 16.89 RENO6003 ¢s/20 pk 16.23
37 Paper Towel, 9-1/8" x 9-1/2" 200 sht/pk white ' REN06003 / GP20204 case/20 pks Paper SCASK1850 ¢s/4000 shts 16.24 REN06002 cs/20 pk 19.57
38 Roll Towel 7-1/2" x 630 BWP716 case/6 paper SCARK6001 cs /12 32.05 BWP716 csl6 30.76
39 Toilet Paper 4.5" x 3.75" 2-ply 500 sht/roll REN06104 / BT235 case/96 Paper SCATM1616 cs/96 37.72 |RENO6104 cs/96 29.41
40 |Workhorse Towels WH300Q9 case/900 paper K41300 cs /900 20.99 WH300Q9 cs/900 72.58
43 |Elements of Water Aero Air neutralizer refill.  TCC400692 / SSS74093 case/12 Restroom & Deodorizers BD474 cs /12 39.95 TCC400692 cs/12 61.80
44 Fragrance System, vanilla bean, Refill, 6 0z.  |REN03540 WTB334726 case/12 Restroom & Deodorizers| HOSPICO cs /12 28.24 | RENO03540 cs/12 61.80

Nature's Blossom. Fragrance System Refill, 6
45 oz. REN03495 case/12 Restroom & Deodorizers| HOSPICO cs/12 28.24 RENO3495 cs/12 61.80
46 Rubbermaid Fragrance refill 5121 case/6 Restroom & Deodorizers| Rubbermaid cs /6 34.29 RCP5121 cs/6 45.92
48 Sanitary Napkins #4 HOSMT-4 case/250 Restroom & Deodorizers| HS - MT4 cs /250 23.97 [HOSMT-4 cs/250 27.50
49 |Sanitary Waxed liners, 7-1/2" x 10" HOSKL-260 case/500 Restroom & Deodorizers HS 260 cs /500 11.80 |HOSKL-260 ¢s/500 15.04
50 Sea Spray, Fragrance System Refill, 6 oz. REN03532 case/12 Restroom & Deodorizers| HOSPICO cs /12 28.24 RENO3532 cs/12 61.80
51 Seat Cleaner, 2/pack HOS86300-6 case/6 Restroom & Deodorizers| HS36300 ¢s/6-300ml 34.19 HOS86300 csl6 37.27

HOSHG-5000 / 2028235 /

52 Seat Cover, Half Fold, Hospital Spec Wht ROC25121973 / ren03800 Case /5000 | Restroom & Deodorizers| HG - 5000 cs /5000 31.74 |HOST6-5000 ¢s/5000 37.06
53 Tampons HOST-500 Case/500 | Restroom & Deodorizers T500 cs /500 49.24 [HOST500 ¢s/500 57.06
54 Toilet Bowl Rim Cages REN03010/ HIL29917 case/12 | Restroom & Deodorizers| HS2901 cs /12 9.94| RENO3010 cs/12 14.63
55 Trade Winds Air Freshener, Variety 112809 case/12 Restroom & Deodorizers|  HS7908 cs /12 28.24 no bid
56 Urinal Mats 11525 / IM-1525 / A68322 Case /6 Restroom & Deodorizers IP1525 cs /6 35.79 SPA8600 cs/6 45.32
57 Urinal Screens HOS 01991 case/12 Restroom & Deodorizers| HS1991 cs/12 13.19| RENO3011 cs/12 12.55
58 Urinal Screens wiblock, 4 oz. RENO3002 / HIL29906 case/12 Restroom & Deodorizers| HOSPICO cs /12 11.63 | RENO3002 cs/12 14.63
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59 Bay West hand soap, 500 ml, pink BWP9510 case/12 Soaps no bid BWP9510 cs/12 26.52
61 Gojo hand soap, 5000 ml 2066664, 7520-02, GJ7520 Case /2 Soaps GJ7520-02 cs/2 29.39 G0J7520 CS/2 32.82
62 Gojo hand soap, bag In box refill, 800 ml GJ9127 / GOJ9127 case/12 Soaps DL96507 cs /12 27.99 G0J9127 CS/12 40.24
63 'Hand Soap, 800 ML RENO2484 case/12 Soaps DL96507 cs /12 27.99 RENO2484 cs/12 33.15
64 Hand Soap, White, Gal. REN02503 case/4 Soaps MISBVP20-GL  cs/4 - gal. 21.60 RENO2503 Ccs/4 29.96
65 Kimberly Clark hand soap 800 ml 91220 Case/ 12 Soaps DL99506 cs /12 24.49 [KCC91220 Ccs/12 44.99
66 Kimberly Clark Shampoo 8 Liter 91726 / 2063014 carton /8 Soaps no bid no bid
67 20" Eraser Burnish Pad, pink MMM25858 case/5 sponges/mops, etc | MMM25858-9 cs/5 27.63|  MMM25858 cs/5 29.98
REN02068 / BC84120 /
68 20" hi pro polish pads,white Prep402 case/5 sponges/mops, etc AC401220 cs/5 12.30|  RENO2068 Ccs/5 22.26
IP5032HG / 5096059 / LAG 32
69 32 oz graduated spray bottles I RENO5121 EA sponges/mops, etc IP5032WG EA 0.31 |RENO5121 EA 0.65
Big Quik - Zephr Household style angle broom,
70 13" 34089 EA sponges/mops, etc ZR34068 EA 4.89 RENO3971 EA 7.70
71 Black Hi Pro Strip Pad MMMO08272 or 8273 or 8276 | case/5 sponges/mops, etc MMM08273-3 cs/5 26.78 |MMMO08272 cs/5 29.64
72 Black Hi Pro Strip Pad 17" REN2015 case/5 sponges/mops, etc AC430517 cs/5 13.99 |REN022005 cs/5 25.66
73 Blue Cleaning Pad 17" REN02035 case/5 sponges/mops, etc AC400417 cs/5 9.95 |REN02035 cs/5 20.29
74 Bowl Brush w/cone 13600 / IM-3600 EA sponges/mops, etc IP3600 EA 251 IM3600 EA 3.39
75 Brute Dolly RCP264000BK EA sponges/mops, etc IP7704 EA 19.90 264000BK EA 43.85
76 Combo-Side Press Bucket Wringer set RM7580 EA sponges/mops, etc RCP7580-88 EA 61.64 758004 EA 64.38
77 Cut-end 24 0z mopheads REN02235 case/12 sponges/mops, etc ZR84088 cs/12 35.84 |REN02235 cs/12 4.69
78 Finney Eraser, 12" X 2" X 2" 1200 case/12 sponges/mops, etc no bid 1200 CcS/12 203.46
79 |Finney Eraser, 18" x 2" x 2" 1800 case/12 sponges/mops, etc no bid 1800 cs/12 237.90
Impack 30-60" Extended Lambswool Duster  [IM3106 / 2136051 / 9C04 /
80 (Rubbermaid) CSM4573300 case/12 sponges/mops, etc Impack EA 6.19 |CSM4573300 Cs/12 98.88
9951-12 / 2093711 / IM204 /
81 |Johnny Mops, Toilet Bowl mop, white IP2116 / RENO5137 EA sponges/mops, etc 1P204 EA 0.46 |[RENO5137 EA 0.77
82 Large blended, fan-tail wet mop, looped ends 5145880 / REN02138 case/12 sponges/mops, etc ZR28303 cs /12 52.54 |REN02138 CS/12 88.92
83 Large looped mops, 5" REN02154 case/12 sponges/mops, etc ZR28103 cs /12 48.20 [RENO2154 Ccs/12 89.88
84 Lobby brooms, approx 36" CSM3685914 / RUB6374 EA sponges/mops, etc ZR36615 EA 2.57 3685914 EA 3.25
85 Lobby dust pans RUB2531 Case/6 sponges/mops, etc IP2602HS EA 9.82| REN03952 Cs/6 66.84
86 Medium looped mops, 5" REN02150 / GS36525B case/12 sponges/mops, etc ZR28102 cs /12 40.29| RENO2150 CS/12 73.32
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87 Mop Head, cut-end wet, white, 24 oz. REN02235 case/12 sponges/mops, etc ZR10024L cs /12 3410 | RENO2235 cs/12 56.28
Mr. Clean Magic Eraser Pads, 4-3/5"x 2-2/5"x
88 1" Pads, 4/PK PGC43516 Case/6 sponges/mops, etc IP7150 EA 1.55 PGC43516 Cs/6 27.23
89 |Plastic Mop bucket (no wringer) RUB7570YW EA sponges/mops, etc | RCP7570-88 EA 42.90 75870Y EA 47.84
90 Red Buffing Pad 17" REN02045 case/5 sponges/mops, etc AC404417 cs/5 9.10 |[RENO2045 Ccs/5 20.30
91 Rubbermaid Trash Can lid, sg. grey RUB2664 EA sponges/mops, etc | RCP2664GY EA 33.20 RUB2664 EA 37.81
92 Rubbermaid Trash Can, 50 Gal, sq. grey RUB3959 EA sponges/mops, et |Rubbermaid EA 83.60 RUB3959 EA 95.21
Scrub Brush (Rubbermaid), Square block,
93 synthetic fill 9B23 EA sponges/mops, etc  |Rubbermaid EA 2.55 9B23 EA 2.98
94 Scrub Brush with handle (Rubbermaid) 9B56 EA sponges/mops, etc  |Rubbermaid EA 1.95 9B56 EA 2.20
Scrubbing pads 3M Scotchbrite #86, 6" x 9",
95 green 61-5000-2592-1, 2030692, case /36 sponges/mops, etc MMM86 cs/ 42.65 |REN02166 CS/15 15.81
Sponges 3M Scotchbrite #74, green/yellow ~ MMM20688/ REN02118/
96 6.1"x3.6"x.7" 2030724 Case /20 sponges/mops, etc MMM74 cs/ 30.79 [MMM20688 CS/20 30.28
97 Trigger sprayers IP4900, REN05116 sponges/mops, etc IP6900 EA 0.31 [REN05116 EA 0.56
Utility Sponge Extra Large, 7-12/" x 4-3/8" x 2-
98 1/16" REN02121 EA sponges/mops, etc IP7180 EA 1.29 | REN02121 EA 1.35
99 Vacuum Bags, for upright vacuums WIN5300 / C1900035 case/10 sponges/mops, etc no bid WIN5300 CS/10 15.87
100 Wet mob handle, 60", Hinged side gate H126 / RCPH146000GY EA sponges/mops, etc ZR16270 EA 9.22 1460006Y EA 13.66
101 Wood-handled large toilet plunger HIL29992 EA sponges/mops, etc IP9200 EA 5.24 IMPACT EA 8.82
TOTAL TOTAL
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